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FORKS Staff Report

Committee of the Whole — April 8, 2019
City Council — April 15, 2019

Agenda Item: Bids for City Project No. 7909 — Upgrade Lift Station No. 7

Submitted by: Engineering Department, Mark S. Walker, PE (Assistant City Engineer)

Staff Recommended Action: Award Schedule B contracts to low bidders as follows:
General Work to CC Steel LLC in the amount of
$233,350 and Electrical Work to RBB Electric, Inc. in
the amount of $95,009 for Project No. 7909 — Upgrade
Lift Station No. 7

Committee Recommended Action:

Council Action:

BACKGROUND:

Bids for this project were received on April 1, 2019 with 4 bidders submitting bids. Bidders are
allowed to submit bids for individual General and Electrical packages or submit a bid for the
combined work of the General and Electrical. Staff recommendation of award was then based
upon the lowest combination of bids that resulted in the lowest price for the entire project. For
this project, individual bids for the General and Electrical work resulted in a lower sum than the
lowest bid for the combined work of the General and Electrical work.

This project is intended to renew Lift Station No. 7 so that it can provide efficient and reliable
service for the next 15 to 20 years. Lift Station No. 7 is located at 3010 Gateway Drive, just east
of the English Coulee and on the North side of Gateway Drive. This station provides sanitary
sewage service for an area generally northward of 10" Ave N and west of Columbia Road and
some properties along the north side of Gateway Drive. Properties served by this station include
The Ralph and the new UND Medical Science Facility. This station was placed in operation in
1962 and was last rehabilitated in 1997. Many of the station components are at the end of their
useful life. During the rehabilitation project in 1997, the elevation of the lift station and adjacent
manholes were raise to protect the station from flooding as it is located adjacent to the English
Coulee.
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The City of Grand Forks owns and operates 42 Sanitary Sewage Lift Stations throughout the
City. Two of these stations are master stations that boost the pressure inside of the forcemain
and the remainder are individual lift stations. Sanitary sewage from within the City is collected
at the individual lift stations where the sewage is then pumped into a force main network
approximately 50 miles in total length. Most of the sewage then passes through one of the two
master lift stations and is ultimately delivered to the City Wastewater Treatment Facility.
Periodically, these lift stations require rehabilitation to upgrade pumps, valves, piping, controls,
electrical systems, ventilation systems, building structure, safety features, and other
appurtenances. To avoid the need to rehabilitate a large number of these stations during a single
fiscal year and cause a strain on the yearly budget, stations are prioritized and the station(s) most
in need of repairs and upgrades are rehabilitated. Current City policy is to rehabilitate a sanitary
lift station every 15 to 20 years.

ANALYSIS AND FINDINGS OF FACT:

e Bids were received on April 1, 2019.

e A total of 4 bids were received and all bids were opened.

e Bidders were allowed to submit bids for either Schedule A (combined bid for General and
Electrical work) or Schedule B (separate bids for General and Electrical work).

e Award would then be based upon the lowest bid combination that would result in the lowest
project cost.

e The lowest bids were based on separate bids (Schedule B) for the General and Electrical

work with the lowest General bid from CC Steel LLC in the amount of $233,350 and the

lowest Electrical bid from RBB Electric, Inc. in the amount of $95,009 for a combined total
project bid of $328,359.

The Engineer’s Estimate for this project is $324,800.

The lowest bid received was approximately 1% above the Engineer’s Estimate.

City staff and staff feel the low bidders are qualified to do the work of this project.

Funding for this project will come from the Wastewater Fund 5200.100.5225.650.0010 Work

in Progress.

e This project will replace pumps, valves, piping, and controls and upgrade various equipment
and appurtenances at the station.

e The equipment and appurtenances proposed to be replaced during this project are near their
life expectancy, worn out, in need of safety improvements, or otherwise unreliable.

e Since the permanent flood protection project is in place, the station no longer needs to be
elevated and the station and adjacent manholes will be lowered during this project which will
allow for easier maintenance, improve safety, and improve aesthetics of the site.

e Currently, the firm of Webster Foster & Weston is under contract to provide design
engineering services and an Amendment to their Agreement will be needed to add
construction engineering services. It is expected that this Amendment will be placed on the
April 22, 2019 Committee of the Whole agenda.

SUPPORT MATERIALS:

e Abstract of Bids Received (1 pages)

e Project Location Map (1 page)

e Page 371 of the 2019 City Budget indicating funding source for this project (1 page)
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BID SUMMARY-UPGRADE LIFT STATION 7

CITY OF GRAND FORKS PROJECT NO. 7909; WFW PROJECT NO. 20G408

April 1, 2019; 2:00 P.M. Local Time

Add

BB

CL

NCA

SCHEDULE A
GENERAL

SCHEDULE B
ELECTRICAL

SCHEDULE B
GENERAL

FUSION AUTOMATION INC.
GRAND FORKS, ND

TOM'S BACKHOE SERVICE, INC.
BRAINERD, MN

CC STEEL LLC
MAPLE PLAIN, MN

NO BID

NO BID

$233,350.00

ICS, INC.
GRAND FORKS, ND

$419,700.00

$319,900.00

NO BID

JOHN'S REFRIGERATION & ELECTRIC, INC.

VALLEY CITY, ND

RBB ELECTRIC, INC.
GRAND FORKS, ND

NO BID

$95,009.00

NO BID

WAGNER CONSTRUCTION
INTERNATIONAL FALLS, MN

SUN ELECTRIC, INC.
FARGO, ND

TAGGART CONTRACTING INC.
NEWFOLDEN, MN

BERGSTROM ELECTRIC
GRAND FORKS, ND

NO BID

$97,730.00

NO BID

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE

5%

$324,800.00

$229,800.00 $95,000.00

APPARENT LOW BIDS

$419,700.00

$233,350.00 $95,009.00

TOTAL APPARENT LOW BIDS, SCHEDULE B

$328,359.00

NCA = Non-Collusion Affidavit




PROJECT
LOCATION

All dimensions, descriptions, measurements, boundaries
and data contained in this nonstandard document are
included for general information only. No warranties or
covenants are made or given by the City of Grand Forks.
Any user must confirm the accuracy of the same with
official records, and/or by survey.
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